
 
 

Meadowbrook College Associate Teaching and Mentoring Staff: Various Hours 
Casual work paid on an hourly basis – School Teachers Pay & Conditions 

Casual work paid on an hourly basis – £11.90 per hour 
 

We are seeking teachers and mentors who can deliver high quality provision across 
the curriculum on a 1:1 basis to children and young people who are excluded from 
school.  This will usually be for a period of around 6-12 weeks at any one time, with 
flexible working hours.    
 
These posts are required to cover short term work throughout Oxfordshire and we 
are particularly keen to receive applications from people living in or near the 
Abingdon and Oxford Areas of Oxfordshire.  Flexible hours are available during term 
time. 
 
We are looking for teachers with a flexible approach, are passionate about working 
with young people with behavioural difficulties and are committed to multi-disciplinary 
approaches.  The ability to teach a range of subjects and experience of teaching 
pupils with SEN or complex needs is desirable.   
 
We are also looking for mentors who can bring a specific a skill or interest, but invite 
applications from all. 
 
Suitable applicants will be interviewed on an on-going basis, once applications 
are received.   
 
Start date as soon as available and when checks are complete. 
 
Meadowbrook College is committed to safeguarding and promoting the welfare of 
children and young people and expect all staff and volunteers to share this 
commitment. All Staff and volunteers are also expected to promote fundamental 
British values.   This post involves the type of work with children and young people, 
that requires applicants to undertake a Disclosure and Barring Service check. The 
possession of a criminal record will not necessarily prevent an applicant from 
obtaining this post. All cases are considered confidentially and according to the 
nature of the role and information disclosed 
 
Further information is available on our website.  Alternatively telephone 01865 
253198 or email officeox@meadowbrookcollege.org for further information.  
 
Completed application forms should be sent to officeox@meadowbrookcollege.org. 
Please note that our recruitment and safeguarding procedures do not allow 
applicants to submit CVs.  All applications must be on our Application Forms 
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